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Married At First Sight Chapter 3416-Carrie’s expression changed drastically. She 
cursed Camryn thousands of times in my heart. 

What she hated most was that Camryn raised a few wolfhounds to bite her. 

“Your villa is open today. Are there any distinguished guests coming?” 

Carrie turned and asked about the developments in the villa. 

The security guard said in a deep voice, “Miss, please leave!” 

He did not answer Carrie’s question. 

Carrie guessed that a distinguished guest was coming; otherwise, the gate of the villa 
would not be open. She looked around but saw no unfamiliar faces. 

At the urging of the security guard, Carrie drove down the mountain angrily. 

She didn’t dare to make a scene like she did last time. 

The York family was treating them to a meal, but she dared to cause trouble at the gate 
of Wildridge Manor and bring shame to the York family. Zachary would crush her to 
death. 

For the York family, crushing her to death is like crushing an ant. 

When she first became Mr. Labbe’s mistress, she thought she had found a powerful 
backer and could ignore the York family. 

But reality told her that she was a chess piece, and when she was useful, Mr. Labbe 
would pamper her. 

She always failed to complete the tasks assigned to her by Mr. Labbe, and Mr. Labbe 
never even looked at her. 

Mr. Labbe came over, and what he liked to do was torture her in matters of s-e-x. He 
had many tricks and forced her to cooperate. Sometimes, he would whip her with a 
whip. 

Carrie thought that she would be able to become the real Mrs. Labbe one day in the 
future, but she decided not to marry such a perverted old man. 



After helping Mr. Labbe get things done, she could break away from his control and take 
the money she earned from him, or she could move away and find an obedient man to 
marry. 

Otherwise, she would force Callum to marry her. She wanted to replace Camryn and 
become the second lady of the York family. 

Mr. Labbe promised her that he would help her get revenge after he succeeded. 

He would also help her fulfill her wish and marry the man she wanted. 

Carrie went down the mountain in disappointment because she knew that she was still 
like a little ant in Wiltspoon. 

After staying at the foot of the mountain for a while and not seeing any strange vehicles 
coming, Carrie called Mr. Labbe. After Mr. Labbe answered the phone, she told Mr. 
Labbe about the situation at Wildridge Manor today. 

After hearing this, Mr. Labbe said, “I suspect the big boss is in the York family.” 

He just couldn’t reach his hand into the York family. 

That big boss was so powerful, no one knew where he came from, but when his people 
were investigating, they all died. 

He only knew that they had come to Wiltspoon. 

Even in Wiltspoon, he couldn’t find any useful information. 

The York family had always been defending like an iron barrel, and now it is defending 
even more firmly. It’s true that a mosquito can’t fly in even if the door of Wildridge Manor 
is open. 

“Don’t you want to go in and take a look? You’ve already been to Wildridge Manor, but 
you don’t even know how to go in.” Mr. Labbe said, Carrie. 

Carrie said aggrievedly, “You think I don’t want to go in? I dream of going in. That’s the 
in-law my mother found for me. But I can’t get in. That b*tch Camryn ordered that no 
matter who I go over there, I must not be allowed in and must get out!” 

“Mr. Labbe.” Carrie said aggrievedly, “You have to help me vent my anger and let 
Camryn suffer a little.” 

Knowing that Mr. Labbe liked to play with women, she added, “Camryn is prettier and 
more elegant than me. She always has a charm as elegant as a chrysanthemum. Mr. 
Labbe, don’t you want to try it?” 



 


